



**SOUTHEAST MISSOURI
STATE UNIVERSITY · 1873**

**INVITATION FOR BID 5810
AMENDMENT 1**

DELIVERY INSTRUCTIONS

For USPS/FedEx/UPS, etc.
Bids must be mailed to:
Purchasing Department
Southeast Missouri State University
One University Plaza, Mail Stop 3280
Cape Girardeau, MO 63701

OR delivered by bidder to:
Purchasing Department
Academic Hall Room 200F
Normal Avenue
Cape Girardeau, MO 63701

TITLE: UNIFORMS

DATE: APRIL 25, 2016

**BUYER: JESSICA KINDER
BUYER**

EMAIL: jlkinder@semo.edu

PHONE: (573) 651-2021

BID MUST BE RECEIVED NO LATER THAN:

DATE: MAY 5, 2016

TIME: 3:30 P.M.

The notice of award is made subject to availability and appropriation of funds, and the selection of the lowest and best bidder is made in accordance with all applicable public procurement laws.

MUST BE SIGNED TO BE VALID

The bidder hereby agrees to furnish items and/or services, at the firm, fixed prices quoted, pursuant to all requirements and specifications contained herein, upon either the receipt of an authorized purchase order from the Purchasing Department or when this document is countersigned by the Purchasing Department as a binding contract, and further agrees that the language of this document shall govern in the event of a conflict with his or her bid.

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE		PRINTED NAME/TITLE	
COMPANY NAME			CURRENT DATE
MAILING ADDRESS			TELEPHONE NUMBER/EXT.
CITY	STATE	ZIP CODE	
CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT PERSON EMAIL ADDRESS		FACSIMILE NUMBER
DELIVERY DATE: _____ DAYS ARO, FOB DESTINATION		PROMPT PAYMENT TERMS: _____% _____ DAYS NET _____ DAYS	
NOTICE OF AWARD (SOUTHEAST MISSOURI STATE UNIVERSITY USE ONLY)			
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE FOR SOUTHEAST MISSOURI STATE UNIVERSITY			DATE

SOUTHEAST MISSOURI STATE UNIVERSITY
UNIFORMS
INVITATION FOR BID 5810

AMENDMENT #1

The bidder is hereby notified that Invitation for Bid 5810 is clarified as follows.

1. *The most recent contracts for Uniforms (for the Law Enforcement Academy) were awarded to:*
 - a. *Brown and Bigelow for windbreakers and polo-type shirts*
 - b. *Galls LLC for BDU pants*
2. *At the time of contract expiration prices (and brands) were:*
 - a. *\$15.09 each for windbreakers (Auburn)*
 - b. *\$10.08 each for polo-type shirts (Gildan)*
 - c. *\$31.99 each for BDU pants (Propper)*
3. *A bid tabulation from the previous bid cycle is attached to this amendment.*
4. *Bid opening date remains May 5, 2016.*

All other terms and conditions of Invitation for Bid 5810 remain the same.

If you have any questions regarding these changes, please contact the Purchasing Department at 573-651-2021.

To acknowledge receipt of this amendment, the bidder should complete, sign, and return such with the bid response.

**IFB 5569, Uniforms (for Law Enforcement Academy)
Opened 08/03/2012**

		BROWN & BIGELOW	CLUB COLORS	EAGLE GROUP	GALLS LLC	SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	Windbreaker	\$14.79	\$18.75	\$17.20	\$47.98	NO BID
2	Pique polo-type shirt	\$9.88	\$20.00	\$11.50	\$29.98 (SM-XL) \$31.98 (2X & XLT) \$34.98 (3X & XLT)	NO BID
3.1	Military style, BDU pants, Black	\$19.48	\$22.50	\$26.10	\$31.99	NO BID
3.2	Military style, BDU pants, Khaki	\$19.48	\$22.50	\$26.10	\$31.99	NO BID

% OFF LIST PRICE	30.00%	50.00%	0.00%	5.00%
% INCREASE YEAR 2	2.00%	2.00%	10.00%	5.00%
% INCREASE YEAR 3	3.00%	2.00%		5.00%